

BID TABULATION SHEET

Title: Furnishing and Delivery of Irrigation Repair Parts for Irrigation Systems for Golf Courses of Somerset County Park Commission, New Jersey

Opening Date: Wednesday, February 24, 2016 - 2:30pm

Contract #: PCC-0016-16

Total Bids Received: 2	Signed Proposal	Stock Disclose	Non-Collusion	Affirm Action	NJ BRC	IRAN	Co-op	CD	Excep.	Notes
Storr Tractor Company 3191 Route 22 Branchburg, NJ 08876	X	X	X	4399	X	X	N/A	Y	Y*	
Siteone Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street Cleveland, OH 44114	X	X	X	34998	X	X	N/A	Y	Y**	
*Exceptions Storr Tractor Company	<p>Service work shall be performed at \$115.00/hour, should a boom, crane truck, Field Fabrication or Field Welding be required the County will be provided an estimate for that additional services for their consideration.</p> <p>STC LIST Shall refer to the Storr Tractor Established List Price's and Allied Price's materials published for 2016, the exception will be for DURA Plastic products which will be off of DURA's current published LIST PRICE publication.</p>									
**Exceptions SiteOne Landscape Supply	<p>General Instructions: #18 Indemnification</p> <p>*It is the intent of the parties to this contract that the indemnities shall, in all instances , except for loss or damage resulting from the negligence of the indemnitee, be indemnified against all liability, loss or damage of any nature whatsoever. -removed "sole"</p>									

Furnishing and Delivery of Irrigation Repair Parts for Irrigation Systems for Golf Courses of Somerset County Park Commission PCC-0016-16		Storr Tractor Company			SiteOne Landscape Supply		
		Repair Parts % Discount from List Price			Repair Parts % Discount from List Price		
	Item	Manufacturer	Delivered	Picked-Up	Manufacturer	Delivered	Picked-Up
1	Heads - 800 Series - Wholegoods				Toro 800 series	50.50%	52.00%
		Toro	35% Toro List	35% Toro List	Rainbird 5000	48.50%	51.50%
					Hunter psp	63.50%	65.50%
2	Parts for 600, 700, 800 Series Heads				Toro		
		Toro	35% Toro List	35% Toro List	Hunter	63.50%	65.00%
					Rainbird	50.00%	52.00%
3	Flowtronex Pump Control	ABB, Allen Bradley					
		Flowtronex	40% STC List	40% STC List	Flowtronics	42.50%	44.50%
		US Electric Motor					
4	SDR21 PVC Pipe						
		Ipex, Cresline	40% STC List	40% STC List	Cresline	72.29%	73.75%
5	Fittings	Dura	75% Dura List	75% Dura List			
		Lasco, Spears	50% STC List	50% STC List	Spears	62.50%	64.50%
		Harco	40% STC List	40% STC List			
6	Repair Couplers	Flo Control, Hymax	40% STC List	40% STC List			
		Harco	40% STC List	40% STC List	Spears	55.00%	58.00%
7	Repair Tools	Greenlee	40% STC List	40% STC List			
		Toro	35% STC List	35% STC List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8	Valves	Kitz, Nibco, Waterous,			Toro	40.00%	42.00%
		Watts, Cla-Val	40% STC List	40% STC List	Hunter	48.00%	50.00%
					Rainbird	48.50%	51.50%
9	Filters	American, Amiad, Granby,					
		Netafim, VAF, Arlal	40% STC List	40% STC List	Vu-Flow	34.50%	36.50%
10	Pond Aerators						
		Otterbine	0% Otterbine List	0% Otterbine List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	Sub Surface Aerators						
		Otterbine	0% Otterbine List	0% Otterbine List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Furnishing and Delivery of Irrigation Repair Parts for Irrigation Systems for Golf Courses of Somerset County Park Commission PCC-0016-16		Storr Tractor Company			SiteOne Landscape Supply		
		Repair Parts % Discount from List Price			Repair Parts % Discount from List Price		
	Item	Manufacturer	Delivered	Picked-Up	Manufacturer	Delivered	Picked-Up
12	Power Cable and Wire	Paige	40% STC List	40% STC List	Coleman	60.00%	62.00%
		Otterbine	0% Otterbine List	0% Otterbine List	Page	48.00%	51.00%
13	Communication Equipment	Kenwood, Toro, Maxon, Motorola, Freewave, Banner, B&B Electronics	40% STC List	40% STC List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14	Satellite Controllers	Toro	35% Toro List	35% Toro List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15	Ancillary Equipment	3M, Drycon, Davis, Armada, Tessco, Green Lee, STC Allied Products Prices	40% STC List	40% STC List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
16	Transfer Pump at Neshanic Valley	Danfoss, ABB, ITT Flowtronex, MCI, Krohne, ITT Flygt	40% STC List	40% STC List	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
17	Drainage Pipe	ADS, NDS	40% STC List	40% STC List	NDS	52.00%	54.00%