

VENDOR NAME=>		Daves Suburban Disposal		Jetsam Hauling		Kohler Waste Services Inc.		Premier Disposal		Republic Services	
PART I Haulage & Disposal Tipping Fees are Included in Pricing		PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR
1	Extension Service 310 Milltown Rd Bridgewater	2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	\$520.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.32	\$484.64
Year 2	1 x Week	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	\$520.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.32	\$484.64
2	Senior Wellness Center 876 East Main St Bridgewater	2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard	
Year 1	2 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.64	\$969.28
Year 2	2 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.64	\$969.28
3	Richard Hall CMHC Bridge St. & Vogt Dr. Bridgewater	4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard	
Year 1	2 x Week	\$42.00	\$2,184.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,938.56
Year 2	2 x Week	\$42.00	\$2,184.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,938.56
4	Prosecutors GSA Depot, 156 Rt. 206 Hillsborough	3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$17.00	\$884.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.00	\$728.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.98	\$726.96
Year 2	1 x Week	\$17.00	\$884.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.00	\$728.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.98	\$726.96
5	Prosecutors 209 Cougar Ct. Hillsborough	4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	\$936.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.99	\$969.28
Year 2	1 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	\$936.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.99	\$969.28
6	Hillsborough Nutrition Amwell Rd Hillsborough	2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard	
Year 1	2 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	\$969.28
Year 2	2 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	\$969.28
7	Pistol Range Roycefield Rd Hillsborough	2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard		2 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.32	\$484.64
Year 2	1 x Week	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.32	\$484.64
8	Fire Academy 402 Roycefield Rd Hillsborough (behind County Garage)	4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	\$936.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.99	\$969.28
Year 2	1 x Week	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	\$936.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.99	\$969.28
9	Senior Wellness Center 200 Mount Airy Rd, Bldg 2 Bernardsville	3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard	
Year 1	2 x Week	\$45.00	\$2,340.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.00	\$1,453.92
Year 2	2 x Week	\$45.00	\$2,340.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.00	\$624.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.00	\$1,453.92
10	Board of Social Services 73 East High St Somerville	4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard		4 Cu Yard	
Year 1	2 x Week	\$38.00	\$1,976.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.28	\$1,938.56
Year 2	2 x Week	\$38.00	\$1,976.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	\$1,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.28	\$1,938.56
11	Mary Jacobs Library 64 Washington St Rocky Hill	3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard		3 Cu Yard	
Year 1	1 x Week	\$17.00	\$884.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.98	\$726.96
Year 2	1 x Week	\$17.00	\$884.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.98	\$726.96

PART II Box Rental & Haulage Only Tipping Fees will be billed by BRI Directly to Somerset County		PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR	PER WEEK	PER YEAR
1	Jail 40 Grove St Somerville	Supply Rental of Self-Contained 30 Cu Yd Compactor. Available electric connection is 3 Phase-230 Volt.		Supply Rental of Self-Contained 30 Cu Yd Compactor. Available electric connection is 3 Phase-230 Volt.		Supply Rental of Self-Contained 30 Cu Yd Compactor. Available electric connection is 3 Phase-230 Volt.		Supply Rental of Self-Contained 30 Cu Yd Compactor. Available electric connection is 3 Phase-230 Volt.		Supply Rental of Self-Contained 30 Cu Yd Compactor. Available electric connection is 3 Phase-230 Volt.	
Year 1	3 x Week	\$240.00	\$12,480.00	\$2,100.00	\$109,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$495.00	\$25,740.00
Year 2	3 x Week	\$240.00	\$12,480.00	\$2,100.00	\$117,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$510.00	\$26,520.00
		Per Pull		Per Pull		Per Pull		Per Pull		Per Pull	
2	Various Locations Misc Use	10 Cu Yard		10 Cu Yard		10 Cu Yard		10 Cu Yard		10 Cu Yard	
Year 1	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$185.00	
Year 2	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$191.00	
3	Various Locations Misc Use	20 Cu Yard		20 Cu Yard		20 Cu Yard		20 Cu Yard		20 Cu Yard	
Year 1	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$185.00	
Year 2	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$191.00	
4	Various Locations Misc Use	30 Cu Yard		30 Cu Yard		30 Cu Yard		30 Cu Yard		30 Cu Yard	
Year 1	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$185.00	
Year 2	As Needed PER PULL	\$155.00		\$750.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$191.00	

PART III Haulage ONLY. Tipping Fees will be billed by BRI Directly to Somerset County Recycling		PER MONTH	PER YEAR	PER MONTH	PER YEAR	PER MONTH	PER YEAR	PER MONTH	PER YEAR	PER MONTH	PER YEAR
1	Recycling Center 40 Polhemus La Bridgewater	County Owned compactor. One (1) 40 Cu. Yd. container needs to be supplied by vendor. *County reserves the right to add a second container within the contract period		County Owned compactor. One (1) 40 Cu. Yd. container needs to be supplied by vendor. *County reserves the right to add a second container within the contract period		County Owned compactor. One (1) 40 Cu. Yd. container needs to be supplied by vendor. *County reserves the right to add a second container within the contract period		County Owned compactor. One (1) 40 Cu. Yd. container needs to be supplied by vendor. *County reserves the right to add a second container within the contract period		County Owned compactor. One (1) 40 Cu. Yd. container needs to be supplied by vendor. *County reserves the right to add a second container within the contract period	
Year 1	20 Ea x Mo	\$1,200.00	\$14,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00	\$30,000.00
Year 2	20 Ea x Mo	\$1,200.00	\$14,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$130.00	\$31,200.00

Vendor name: Dave's Suburban Disposal Services Jetsam Hauling Kohler Waste Services Premier Disposal Republic Services

Item#	Location	Container Size	Period/Date	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total
A: Regular Containers																		
Golf Course Pickup Schedules: Nov 1 – Feb 28 – One pickup/week March 1 – Oct 31 – Two pickups/week																		
1	Green Knoll GC	One – 6CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$21.00	18	\$378.00	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$33.30	18	\$599.40
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$21.00	64	\$1,344.00	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$33.30	64	\$2,131.20
2	Spooky Brook GC	One – 6CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	\$28.50	18	\$513.00	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$34.00	18	\$612.00	\$28.00	18	\$504.00
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	\$28.50	64	\$1,824.00	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$34.00	64	\$2,176.00	\$28.00	64	\$1,792.00
3	Warrenbrook GC	One – 6CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$21.00	18	\$378.00	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$33.30	18	\$599.40
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$21.00	64	\$1,344.00	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$33.30	64	\$2,131.20
		One – 8CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$30.00	18	\$540.00	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$42.40	18	\$763.20
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$30.00	64	\$1,920.00	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$42.40	64	\$2,713.60
4	Quail Brook GC	One – 8CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	\$28.50	18	\$513.00	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$46.00	18	\$828.00	\$28.00	18	\$504.00
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	\$28.50	64	\$1,824.00	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$46.00	64	\$2,944.00	\$28.00	64	\$1,792.00
5	NVGC Club House and Maintenance	One – 6CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$34.00	18	\$612.00	\$33.30	18	\$599.40
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$34.00	64	\$2,176.00	\$33.30	64	\$2,131.20
		One – 8CY	Nov 1 – Feb 28 (4 Month)	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	NO BID	18	NO BID	\$46.00	18	\$828.00	\$44.40	18	\$199.20
			Mar 1 – Oct 31 (8 Month)	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	NO BID	64	NO BID	\$46.00	64	\$2,944.00	\$44.40	64	\$2,841.60

B: Park Pickup																		
6	Duke Island Park	One – 20CY	Oct 1 – May 31 On call only	\$145.00	10	\$1,450.00	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$150.00	10	\$1,500.00
		One – 20CY	June 1 – Sep 30 Once a Week	\$145.00	20	\$2,900.00	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	\$150.00	20	\$3,000.00
7	North Branch Park	One – 8CY	Oct 1 – April 30 On call only	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$44.40	10	\$444.00
		One – 8CY	May 1 – Sep 30 Twice/Wk	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	\$44.40	40	\$1,776.00

Vendor name:		Dave's Suburban Disposal Services					Jetsam Hauling			Kohler Waste Services			Premier Disposal			Republic Services		
Item#	Location	Container Size	Period/Date	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total	Price per Pickup	Approx. # of Pickups	Total
8	Sellars Maint. Bldg.	One - 30CY	On Call Only	\$200.00	5	\$1,000.00	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	\$250.00	5	\$1,250.00
9	Colonial Park	One - 20CY	Oct 1 - March 31 On Call Only	\$120.00	10	\$1,200.00	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$130.00	10	\$1,300.00
		One - 20CY	April 1 - April 30 Once a week	\$120.00	4	\$480.00	NO BID	4	NO BID	NO BID	4	NO BID	NO BID	4	NO BID	\$130.00	4	\$520.00
		One - 20CY	May 1 - Sep 30 Twice/Wk	\$120.00	40	\$4,800.00	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	\$130.00	40	\$5,200.00
10	Lord Stirling Stables	One - 8CY	On call only	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$44.40	10	\$444.00
		One - 30CY	On-call only	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	\$150.00	5	\$750.00
11	Buck Garden	Weekly curb-side Pickup	Self 95 Gal Can	NO BID	52	NO BID	NO BID	52	NO BID	NO BID	52	NO BID	NO BID	52	NO BID	\$9.00	52	\$468.00
12	EEC	One - 8CY	On call only	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$44.40	10	\$444.00
		One - 30CY	On-call only	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	NO BID	5	NO BID	\$250.00	5	\$1,250.00
13	Torpey Park	One - 8CY	Oct 1 - March 31 On Call Only	\$35.00	10	\$350.00	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$30.00	10	\$300.00*
		One - 8CY	April 1 - Sep 30 Once a week	\$35.00	45	\$1,575.00	NO BID	45	NO BID	NO BID	45	NO BID	NO BID	45	NO BID	\$30.00	45	\$1,350.00*
14	Natrirar Park	One - 8CY	Oct 1 - April 30 On call only	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$50.16	10	\$501.60*
		One - 8CY	May 1 - Sep 30 Once a Week	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	\$50.16	20	\$1,003.20*
15	Skillman Park	One - 8CY	On call only	\$45.00	10	\$450.00	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$44.40	10	\$444.00
16	Mountain View Park	One - 8CY	Oct 1 - April 30 On call only	\$45.00	10	\$450.00	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$39.50	10	\$395.00	\$44.40	10	\$444.00
		One - 8CY	May 1 - Sep 30 Twice/Wk	\$45.00	40	\$1,800.00	NO BID	40	NO BID	NO BID	40	NO BID	\$39.50	40	\$1,580.00	\$44.40	40	\$1,776.00
17	Gaiser Park	One - 8CY	On call only	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	NO BID	10	NO BID	\$44.40	10	\$444.00

C: Roll-Off Containers (Dumpsters)

All dumpsters will be furnished by the Contractor for on site use year round. The contractor will pay the tipping fee at the Bridgewater Transfer Station. The Contractor shall present a copy of the tipping charge receipt issued by the Bridgewater Transfer Station and bill the Park Commission for the same amount plus trucking fee as quoted below.

Item #	Location	Dumpster Size	Period	Trucking Fee	Trucking Fee	Trucking Fee	Trucking Fee	Trucking Fee
18	Green Knoll GC	One - 12CY	On Call Only	\$175.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
19	Spooky Brook GC	One - 30CY	On Call Only	\$145.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20	Neshanic Valley GC	One - 30CY	On Call Only	\$145.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

*Mathematical error as submitted by vendor corrected